
STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

Not
Enacted

Alabama

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Alaska

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Not
Enacted

Arizona

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southwest

Not
Enacted

Arkansas

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

California

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Enacted

Colorado

Any municipality that adopts or updates building codes is
also required to adopt or exceed the 2021 IECC.

Establishing Policies

HB 22-1362 (2022)

West 2022

Not
Enacted

Connecticut

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Northeast

Not
Enacted

Delaware

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/?view_args%255B0%255D=320&text=&order=field_imp_progress&sort=asc
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/?view_args%255B0%255D=320&text=&order=title_1&sort=desc
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/?view_args%255B0%255D=320&text=&order=field_state_region&sort=asc
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/?view_args%255B0%255D=320&text=&order=policy_components_progress&sort=asc
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/?view_args%255B0%255D=320&text=&order=field_imp_year&sort=asc
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/alabama
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/alaska
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/arizona
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/arkansas
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/california
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/colorado
https://leg.colorado.gov/bills/hb22-1362
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/connecticut
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/delaware


Not
Enacted

Florida

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Georgia

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Hawai‘i

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Not
Enacted

Idaho

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Enacted

Illinois

The Illinois Capital Development Board approved the
Illinois Residential Stretch Code on April 9, 2024. The Code
will be available for municipalities to adopt by October 31,
2024.

Establishing Policies

SB 2408 (2021)

Illinois Residential Stretch Code (2024)

Midwest 2024

Not
Enacted

Indiana

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Iowa

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/florida
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/georgia
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/hawaii
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/idaho
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/illinois
https://ilga.gov/legislation/102/SB/PDF/10200SB2408enr.pdf
https://cdb.illinois.gov/business/codes/illinois-energy-codes/illinois-stretch-energy-code.html
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/indiana
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/iowa


Not
Enacted

Kansas

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Kentucky

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Louisiana

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Enacted

Maine

The Maine Uniform Building and Energy Code (MUBEC)
Stretch Code incorporates 2021 IECC and certain
appendices.

Establishing Policies

LD 1543 (2019)

Maine Uniform Building and Energy Code
(MUBEC) Stretch Code (2021) 

Northeast 2021

Not
Enacted

Maryland

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Enacted

Massachusetts

The Stretch Energy Code is 2021 IECC with Massachusetts
amendments, and the Specialized Code is a municipal opt-
in code that is designed to ensure new construction is
consistent with the state's target of net-zero emissions by
2050.

Establishing Policies

S.9 (2021)

225 CMR 22.00 (2022)

225 CMR 23.00 (2022)

Building Energy Codes

Northeast 2023

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/kansas
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/kentucky
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/louisiana
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/maine
https://legislature.maine.gov/LawMakerWeb/summary.asp?LD=1543&SessionID=13
https://www.maine.gov/dps/fmo/sites/maine.gov.dps.fmo/files/inline-files/Chapter6.pdf
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/maryland
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/massachusetts
https://malegislature.gov/bills/192/S9
https://www.mass.gov/regulations/225-CMR-2200-massachusetts-stretch-code-and-specialized-code-for-low-rise-residential-2023-residential-low-rise-amendments-to-iecc2021-and-irc-2021-chapter-11-energy-efficiency
https://www.mass.gov/regulations/225-CMR-2300-massachusetts-front-end-amendments-to-the-international-energy-conservation-code-2021-massachusetts-stretch-energy-code-2023-commercial-amendments-to-iecc2021
https://www.mass.gov/info-details/building-energy-code


Not
Enacted

Michigan

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Minnesota

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Mississippi

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Missouri

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Montana

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Not
Enacted

Nebraska

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Nevada

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Not
Enacted

New Hampshire

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Northeast

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/michigan
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/minnesota
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/mississippi
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/missouri
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/montana
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/nebraska
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/nevada
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/new-hampshire


Not
Enacted

New Jersey

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Northeast

Not
Enacted

New Mexico

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southwest

Enacted

New York

The NYStretch Energy Code: 2020 is a voluntary locally
adopted stretch energy code that offers municipalities a
more energy-efficient alternative to the minimum state
energy code.

Establishing Policies

NYStretch Energy Code: 2020 (2020)

Northeast 2020

Not
Enacted

North Carolina

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

North Dakota

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Ohio

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Oklahoma

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southwest

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/new-jersey
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/new-mexico
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/new-york
https://www.nyserda.ny.gov/All-Programs/Programs/Energy-Code-Training/NYStretch-Energy-Code-2020
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/north-carolina
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/north-dakota
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/ohio
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/oklahoma


Enacted

Oregon

The Oregon Reach Code is a statewide optional energy
construction standard approved by the Building Codes
Division.

Establishing Policies

Executive Order 20-04 (2020)

Oregon Revised Statute (ORS) 455.500 (2021)

Oregon Commercial Reach Code (2022)

Oregon Residential Reach Code (2023)

West 2023

Not
Enacted

Pennsylvania

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Northeast

Enacted

Rhode Island

The Rhode Island Stretch Codes are used on a voluntary
basis for private and public building construction and
renovation projects.

Establishing Policies

Rhode Island Stretch Codes (2018)

Northeast 2018

Not
Enacted

South Carolina

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

South Dakota

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

Not
Enacted

Tennessee

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/oregon
https://www.oregon.gov/bcd/Documents/eo-energy-20-04.pdf
https://oregon.public.law/statutes/ors_455.500
https://www.oregon.gov/bcd/codes-stand/Pages/reach.aspx#:~:text=Aug.%206%252C%202021-,Commercial%20Reach%20Code,-The%20Oregon%20Commercial
https://www.oregon.gov/bcd/codes-stand/Pages/reach.aspx#:~:text=same%20subject%20matter.-,Residential%20Reach%20Code,-The%20Oregon%20Residential
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/pennsylvania
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/rhode-island
http://www.energy.ri.gov/policies-programs/lead-by-example/rhode-island-stretch-codes.php
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/south-carolina
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/south-dakota
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/tennessee


Not
Enacted

Texas

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southwest

Not
Enacted

Utah

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Enacted

Vermont

The Vermont Residential Energy Building Standards
(RBES) Stretch Code is a building energy code for
residential buildings that achieves greater energy savings
than the statewide RBES.

Establishing Policies

Act 89 of 2013 (2013)

30 V.S.A. § 51 (2020)

Vermont Residential Energy Building Standards
(RBES) Stretch Code (2024) 

Northeast 2024

Not
Enacted

Virginia

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Washington

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

Not
Enacted

West Virginia

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Southeast

Not
Enacted

Wisconsin

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

Midwest

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/texas
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/utah
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/vermont
https://legislature.vermont.gov/Documents/2014/Docs/ACTS/ACT089/ACT089%20As%20Enacted.pdf
https://legislature.vermont.gov/statutes/section/30/002/00051#:~:text=(5)%20%25E2%2580%259CStretch%20code%25E2%2580%259D%20means%20a%20building%20energy,RBES%20and%20is%20adopted%20in%20accordance%20with
https://publicservice.vermont.gov/efficiency/building-energy-standards/residential-building-energy-standards
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/virginia
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/washington
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/west-virginia
https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/wisconsin


Not
Enacted

Wyoming

Stretch building energy codes are an optional, more
stringent building code established by the state that local
jurisdictions can adopt to require that newly constructed
buildings are more efficient than the baseline state codes.

West

STATUS STATE REGION COMPONENTS YR
ENACTED

https://www.climatepolicydashboard.org/states/wyoming

